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RE: MyPaymentsPlus

Janet Roberts <Janet.Roberts@slcschools.org> Thu, Feb 13, 2014 at 4:32 PM
To: Michael Clara <donmiguelsic@gmail.com>

Cc: Kristi Swett <Kristi.Swett@slcschools.org>, Heather Bennett <heatherbennett@xmission.com>, McKell Withers
<McKell.Withers@slcschools.org>, Kristina Kindl <Kristina.Kindi@slcschools.org>

Mr. Clara:

When someone responds to an RFP, they are not required to fill out the form that we provided you a copy
of. They are required to answer the questions in the RFP and provide it to us. None of the companies
who provided bids to us for this RFP filled out the form. All of the companies provided a packet of
information in response to the RFP.

As | stated in the email | just sent you, the RFP materials we received from the company who was
awarded the contract are contained in a three ring binder and is very large. If you would like to come to
the district and review the materials, we would be happy to make it available for you. If there is a specific
page of the RFP you are looking for, we could copy that page for you. What exactly are you looking for?

Janet

From: Michael Clara [mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 4:23 PM

To: Janet Roberts

Subject: RE: MyPaymentsPlus

Janet,

I'm asking for a copy of the document you sent me, that has the signature and date on it. The one you sent me is
blank and does not display any information.

If it is to difficult for you to fulfill that simple request, | can submit a GRAMA request.
Your continued display of disrespect for the office that | hold is getting old.
Shalom,

Michael Clara
801-205-0389

On Feb 13, 2014 4:08 PM, "Janet Roberts" <Janet.Roberts@slcschools.org> wrote:


mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com
tel:801-205-0389
mailto:Janet.Roberts@slcschools.org

Mr. Clara:

Listed below is a link to the RFP Selection Recap Sheet that is posted on our website for the School
Lunch Accounting System. The RFP materials we received from the company who was awarded the
contractisin athree ring binder and is very large. If you would like to come to the district and review
the materials, we would be happy to make it available for you.

http://www.slcschools.org/departments/purchasing/solicitations/documents/RECAP-M1383-LS.pdf

Sincerely,

Janet

From: Michael Clara [mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 1:24 PM

To: Janet Roberts

Subject: RE: PaymentsPlus

Janet,

This appears to be a blank form. Can you please provide me a copy of the signed and dated one, with the
company that was awarded the contract ?

Shalom,

Michael Clara
801-205-0389

On Feb 11, 2014 10:51 AM, "Janet Roberts" <Janet.Roberts@slcschools.org> wrote:

Mr. Clara:

We do not have a contract with My Payments Plus. The Request for Proposal is attached that
outlines our terms with them. (Page 4—-2.10to 2.13).

Janet

From: Michael Clara [mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, February 10, 2014 1:51 PM
To: Janet Roberts


http://www.slcschools.org/departments/purchasing/solicitations/documents/RECAP-M1383-LS.pdf
mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com
tel:801-205-0389
mailto:Janet.Roberts@slcschools.org
mailto:donmiguelslc@gmail.com

Subject: PaymentsPlus

Janet,

Can you please send me a copy of the contract the district
has with the paymentsplus company? Thanks.

Un abrazo,

Michael Clara
801-205-0389

Board Member, District 2
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